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Generation One 
 

1. Nathaniel Boulter #74968, b. in Hertfordshire, England, occupation Tanner and Currier. 
 
 He married Alice (unidentified) #74969. 
  
 Alice: 
 Nathaniel met his wife-to-be on the voyage from England to Montreal, and married in Montreal on arrival. 
 
    Children: 
 
    2. i. George Boulter #74970 b. 05 December 1799. 
 
    3. ii. Sarah Boulter #74992 b. c. 1817. 
 
 

Generation Two 
 

2. George Boulter #74970, b. 05 December 1799 in Montreal, Lower Canada,1,2 occupation Tanner and Currier, 
occupation 1871 Agriculturalist in Belleville, d. 18 May 1883 in Picton?,2 buried in Glenwood Cemetery, Picton, Prince 
Edward County, Ontario.2 . 

  
  
 1819: Arrived in Prince Edward County from Montreal, settled on Big Island, Lot 13. 
  
  
 Pioneer Life on the Bay of Quinte, 1905; The Boulter Family; (pages 180 - ) 
  
 "At the beginning of the last century when men spoke of going West, they alluded to the lands fringing the lakeside. 

"West" to the Montreal man meant the new townships laid out on our Bay. The intervening concessions had been 
settled on the Front, even a little to the rear; but the country behind the lake front was practically an unknown 
region, left to the Indians and a few adventurous traders. 

  
 "It was then the Bay of Quinte district that George Boulter, Esq., alluded to when he said he was going West in 1819. 

He was a young man of English parentage, who was born in Montreal. 
  
 "His father, Nathaniel, who was a tanner and currier, and followed that business, came from rural Hertfordshire. On 

the voyage out he made the acquaintance of a young woman with whom he fell in love. They were married upon 
landing at Montreal, where they settled down, and George, our pioneer, was born. 

  
 "While still a young man George Boulter crossed to Big Island, where he settled on lot 13. The land at that time 

belonged to the Mississagas, and he had annually to pay them a rental of a barrel of flour. 
  
 "Soon settling, he next married. His first wife was Sarah Peck, who drew two hundred acres of land in Mariposa 

township, she being the daughter of a United Empire Loyalist. They were married by Rev. Robert McDowell, a 
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pioneer Presbyterian minister, and had ten children. On the death of Sarah, he married Letitia Wilson, who bore him 
eleven more, making him the father of a family of twenty-one. This number of children in any one family has not 
often been exceeded in Prince Edward County. The pioneer was a Captain of the Sedentary Militia and he rallied a 
Company during the Rebellion of '37. But his services were not required, for the Rebellion was suppressed without 
any great difficulty, finally he removed to Belleville, where he died at the old age of about eight-three of eighty-four 
years. 

  
 "The Boulters have always been active in the public affairs of the county. Nathaniel James, the eldest son of the 

pioneer, was appointed a Justice of the Peace more than forty years ago. He was a member of the Sophiasburgh 
Council for seven years; and had been for many more, a prominent member of the Orange Order. He was Master of 
L.O.L. 574 for three years; County Master, for eight; and Grand Treasurer for Central Ontario for three years. At the 
time of the Rebellion of '37 he was a Lieutenant in Captain Daniel Ruttan's Company of Militia. His son, George H. 
Boulter, served as a bandsman in the Fifteenth Regiment. It was stationed in Prescott at the time of the battle of 
Ridgeway during the Fenian Raid, and he received the medal and grant of land. 

  
 "George H. Boulter, M.D., graduate McGill University, the second son of the pioneer, was for twenty-five years a 

surgeon of the 49th Regiment of Hastings County. He retired with the rank of Lieut.-Colonel. He took a keen interest 
in educational matters, being Chairman of the High School Board od Stirling for many years. In his political 
convictions he was a Conservative. He was elected and M.P.P four times, serving sixteen years. He was a member of 
the first Ontario Legislature after the formation of the Dominion. 

  
 "Emily Boulter, a daughter of the pioneer, married William Ryerson Dempsey, who sat in the local Parliament for one 

term. 
  
 "The first canning factory in Central Ontario was built in 1882, by Wellington Boulter, the fourth son of the pioneer, 

who was born in 1838. He was president of the Canadian Packers Association, from its inception for thirteen years. 
On his retirement he was presented with an illuminated address and a gold watch, in token of appreciation of the 
service he had rendered the Association. He has always taken an active interest in the public affairs of Picton. For 
three years he was a member of the town Council and Chairman of the High School Board, and has twice been 
elected Mayor. In his connection with the Orange Order he is at present Chairman, and has been Manager of the 
Local Board of the Loyal True Blue Orphanage in Picton. This institution was established in 1898 in the home of the 
late J.S. McQuaig, ex-M.P. He is also Past Grand Master of Bay of Quinte I.O.O.F. and a charter member of the 
encampment of that order. 

  
 "As has been stated he is the pioneer of the canning industry in Eastern Ontario, and industry which bids fair to 

become a great source of wealth and benefit to the numerous farmers surrounding the localities in which many of 
them are situated. When he first started a small canning factory in 1882, there were many "wise men of the East" 
who with the pessimism peculiar to their type, predicted failure; but undeterred by discouraging advice, Mr. Boulter, 
with a steady determination, which has always been characteristic of his policy in doing things, persevered and 
gradually succeeded in paving the successful way as a canning manufacturer, which many others have since pleased 
to follow. When he first started the business, the methods and appliances were, compared with the present day, 
decidedly primitive. Peas were then shelled by hand and measured with a quart cup, and corn cut off the co=b by 
hand with a butcher's knife, and to put up from six to eight thousand cans a day, was considered an excellent record. 
At present, one pea machine can thresh and shell two tons from the straw complete in twenty minutes. The business 
once content with six thousand cans of peas per day, which was considered such remarkable capacity during the 
inception of the industry, is now not satisfied with less than thirty-five thousand cans as the average minimum, and 
arrangements are being made to exceed this high figure. Corn, which in the beginning was treated as stated above, 
now is operated by the celebrated Sprague Corn cutter, a machine which was invented and perfected by a relative of 
Mr. Boulter's wife, who is herself one of the pioneer Sprague family, and related to the farm implement and 
machinery manufacturers of that family names. 
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 "Several of these Sprague Corn cutters are in operation in Mr. Boulter's factory during the season, and each machine 
treats from eight hundred to ten hundred bushels per day, cutting off the corn and scraping the cob, and the 
continuation of this process includes the treatment of the corn in improved process kettles; the required cooking 
being all done by dry steam supplied by two on-hundred horse power boilers. As an evidence of the capacity and the 
results of Mr. Boulter's factories, we were show the photograph of one solid train of 20 cars, all loaded to full 
capacity, with the Boulter goods and shipped to the Pacific coast. In 1887 Mr. Boulter sent the first car of canned 
goods that crossed the continent over the C.P.R. to Victoria. The canning industry of the Bay of Quinte and Eastern 
Ontario have proved a great boon to the agriculturalist. Mr. Boulter has paid to the grower as high as $90.00 for the 
yield of one acre of peas, and $1,000 for three acres of strawberries grown to his order. Mr. Boulter, since he 
commenced business as a manufacturer twenty-four years ago, has paid for produce over a million dollars to the 
agriculturalists of his immediate district. 

  
 Mr. Boulter, at the request of the Canadian Government, sent an exhibit to Tokio, Japan, and obtained the highest 

obtainable awards. He also obtained the Columbia Medal at the World's Fair, Chicago, 1903; gold medal, Paris 1900; 
at "Glasgow Exhibition, 1901; the Pan American medal, 1901; and the silver medal at the Provincial Exhibition for 
Ontario, held at Kingston. The canning industry, when it assumed proportions which had outgrown the advantage of 
individual ownership, was largely. Through Mr. Boulter's promotion, formed into an amalgamated industry in the 
form of a joint stock company. This consummation was brought about in March, 1903, and comprised thirty-two of 
the principal canning factories of Ontario, with a capital stock of $2,500,000, with $1,600,000 paid up, with preferred 
and common stock, non assessable. The head office of the company is at Hamilton, under the name of the Canadian 
Canners, Limited, where all the business is managed and directed. 

  
 "The manager, Mr. David Marshall, of Aylmer, with nine directors, one of whom is Mr. Wellington Boulter, control 

the operations of the corporation, but each local factory is managed by its former owner. 
  
 "George E. Boulter, eldest son of Wellington Boulter, is at the present time local manager, under his father, of their 

large factory at Picton, established 1882, and chairman of the Public School Board. Frank E.N, Boulter, his second 
son, is, at time of writing (1905), local manager for the canning factory at Port Hope, which is one of the largest 
concerns included in the Canadian Canners, Limited. 

  
 "His third son, Dr. James H. Boulter, was born in 1878. He entered McGill College and took an eight years' course, 

and completed it at the end of six years, in arts and medicine, during which time he was president of the Athletic 
Association and manager of the Football Club. He obtained the cyclist championship of the college, and for two years 
held the record unbeaten. He graduated in 1903, obtaining the degree of B.A., M.D., and C.M. Soon after, he went to 
St. Paul, Minnesota, passed the Medical Council, standing second on the list of thirty-six candidates, sixteen of whom 
failed to reach the requisite standard. Following up this success, he repaired to Lansing, Michigan, and passed the 
Medical Council of that State, with ninety-three percent to his credit, out of a possible hundred. Immediately after 
this he passed the Medical Council of Ontario, his native province., with honors. All these degrees entitle him to 
practice in six States of the Union, beside the Province of Ontario, and it is worthy of note that he took all these 
several examinations within a space of two months. He is now successfully practising his profession in the city of 
Detroit. 

  
 "A daughter married Mr. E.M. Young, Barrister, County Clerk, and a leading lawyer of Prince Edward County. Two 

unmarried daughters, Helen Louise and Lillian Leona, reside with their parents. 
  
 "As a citizen, Mr. Boulter, by his hospitality, and the keen, unselfish interest in the public good, has won himself a 

place in the hears and memories of the people. 
  
 "On the call of the motherland to her colonies for assistance during the late war in South Africa, the 16th Battalion of 

Prince Edward was permitted to send four men. Out of these, three were from Mr. Boulter's factory, to wit, Capt. 
Wall, Color, Sergeant Croft, and Christopher Holland. Mr. Boulter, who is a thorough loyalist, helped to organize at 
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splendid "send-off" to the men. It was a most hearty one, in which the whole town took part, and Mr. Boulter, in 
addition to this, so we since learn, have each of the four volunteers the sum of $15.00 as a "good luck and 
Godspeed" to the far away scene of action. Some time afterwards five more men of the county went out to assist in 
the great struggle, and Mr. Boulter arranged another equally popular and triumphal departure, and, through his 
efforts, the town council granted $50.00 to each of the contingent, and the county council the same amount. On the 
return of these soldiers, Picton gave them a splendid welcome home, and Mr. Boulter, who was chairman of the 
Reception and Welcome Home Committee, gave each of the men a British sovereign, believing it to be a medal of 
practical benefit. [Ed. Originally worth one pound sterling, the sovereign was a gold coin weighing .2354 troy ounces] 

  
 "In other respects than as a manufacturer has Mr. Boulter advanced the town of Picton. In 1903 he built one of the 

finest skating rinks to be found in the province; its dimensions are 190 by 75 feet, all covered with galvanized iron, 
with two club rooms, reception rooms for ladies and gentlemen, and two large gymnasiums for either sex. 

  
 "Looking out of the large bay window of Mr. Boulter's office are to be seen two fine cannon, each of them having its 

own history in the part it played in the Canadian war of defence. One is a thirty-two pounder, made in 1907, and did 
execution against the Americans at the battle of Queenston Heights. The other, a thirty pounder, made in 1912, and 
doubtless cast specially to do service in the war of that period, and afterwards used at the battle of the windmill, in 
the rebellion of 1837-38. These historic relics of the war and rebellion are interesting links of the past with our 
present peaceful Dominion, and are very much prized by Mr. Boulter, who as many times given evidence in a 
substantial manner that he is a loyal son of the Empire." 

 
 He married (1) Sarah Peck #74971,1 b. 29 September 1798,3 (daughter of James Peck #106015 and (unidentified) 

#106016), d. 01 February 1841 in Picton?,3 buried in Glenwood Cemetery, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario.3 
 
    Children: 
 
    4. i. Nathaniel James Boulter #74973 b. c. 1822. 
 
    5. ii. Charlotte S. Boulter #74982. 
 
    6. iii. Theodore H. Boulter #74988. 
 
    7. iv. Sarah Boulter #74989. 
 
    8. v. George Henry Boulter #74974 b. c. 1823. 
 
    9. vi. Matilda (Mary?) Boulter #75001 b. c. 1833. 
 
    10. vii. Emily Boulter #75014 b. c. 01 November 1835. 
 
    11. viii. Wellington Boulter #74995 b. c. 14 February 1838. 
 
    12. ix. Collingwood Boulter #75025 b. c. June 1840. 
 
 He married (2) Letitia Wilson #74972, b. c. 1813 in New Jersey?, United States of America.4 
 
    Children: 
 
    13. x. Edward Boulter #75031. 
 
    14. xi. Maria Boulter #75027 b. c. 1843. 
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    15. xii. Wilson Boulter #75033 b. c. December 1849. 
 
    16. xiii. Franklin (Frank) Boulter #75035 b. c. 1852. 
 
    17. xiv. Alice Boulter #192864 b. c. 1853. 
 
    18. xv. Florence Boulter #192865 b. c. 26 December 1855. 
 
    19. xvi. Marion Boulter #75036 b. c. 1858. 
 
    20. xvii. Wallace Boulter #75037 b. c. 1860. 
 
    21. xviii. Nelson Boulter #75032 b. 14 February 1847. 
 
3. Sarah Boulter #74992, b. c. 1817 in Montreal. 
 
 She married James L. Bell #74993, 01 March 1873 in Belleville, Hastings County, Ontario,5 b. c 1811 in England, 

occupation 1873 Professor of Music. 
 
 

Generation Three 
 

4. Nathaniel James Boulter #74973, b. c. 1822 in Belleville, Hastings County, Ontario,1,6 occupation 1861 Farmer in 
Sophiasburgh, occupation 1871 Farmer and Brick Maker in Sophiasburgh,6 d. 03 June 1905 in Big Island?.1 . 

  
  
 Family lived on Big Island. Eight children, with two dying in infancy. 
 
 He married Mary Fortier #74975, 16 August 1846 in Sophiasburgh Township?, Prince Edward County, Ontario,1,7 b. 

25 December 1824 in Demorestville, Sophiasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,6,8 (daughter of William Fortier 
#105311 and Mary Thompson #105312 [Seamstress in Sophiasburgh Township]), d. 24 January 1913 in Belleville, 
Hastings County, Ontario.8 

  
 Mary: 
 * Surname appears as "FORTIN" on 1846 marriage record **. 
 
    Children: 
 
    22. i. Sarah Leticia Boulter #74976 b. 26 October 1848. 
 
    23. ii. Mary Emma Boulter #74979 b. c. 1844 - 1853. 
 
    24. iii. George Henry Boulter #74977 b. c. 26 February 1850. 
 
    25. iv. Charles Wilson Boulter #74978 b. c. 1855. 
 
    26. v. James Havelock Boulter #74980 b. c. 1864. 
 
    27. vi. Frederick Albert Boulter #110358 b. c. 1870 *. 
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5. Charlotte S. Boulter #74982, b.1. 
  
  
 Lived in Washington (state?). 
 
 She married (1) James Carpenter Howell #74983.1 
  
 James: 
 Lived in Roslin, no children. 
 
  
 She married (2) Archie Fowler #74984.1 
  
 Archie: 
 Family settled in Washington. 
 
6. Theodore H. Boulter #74988, b.1 d. in childhood.1 . 
7. Sarah Boulter #74989, b.1. 
  
  
 Four children: John, Henry, Althena and Ida. Are they from first husband Henry BOULTER? 
 
 She married (1) Henry Boulter #74990. 
  
 Henry: 
 Was he a step-brother? 
 
  
 She married (2) (unidentified) Vorhees #74991,1 occupation Army Colonel. 
  
 (unidentified): 
 Surname also appears as "VOORHEES", "VOOHIS", "VAN VOORHEES"... 
 Settled in Chicago, Illinois. 
 
8. George Henry Boulter #74974, b. c. 1823 in Big Island?, Prince Edward County, Ontario,1 occupation Surgeon, 49th 

Regiment of Hastings County,1 d. 18 January 1894 in Stirling, Hastings County, Ontario.9 . 
  
  
 Lived in Stirling, Hastings County, Ontario. 
 
 He married (1) Deborah Grass #74985,1 b. c. 1835 in Canada West,10 (daughter of Robert Everett Grass #111793 

[Farmer in Sidney Township] and Nancy Purdy #178749), d. before 1891. 
 
    Children: 
 
    28. i. Florence Boulter #74987 b. c. August 1859. 
 
 He married (2) Esther Emma Maria Grass #220318, 04 August 1891 in Kingston, Frontenac County, Ontario,11 b. c. 

1854 in Kingston, Frontenac County, Ontario (daughter of Charles Grass #211543 [Farmer in Kingston Township] and 
Isabella Ann Graham #211544). 
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 Esther: 
 1894: Informant at husband's death, lived in Stirling. 
 
9. Matilda (Mary?) Boulter #75001, b. c. 1833 in Big Island?.1,12 . 
  
  
 1891: Widowed, lived in Percy Township, Northumberland County with daughter Alice. 
 
 She married John Cummings #75002,1 b. c. 1830 in Ontario,12 d. before 1891 in Percy Township?, occupation 1871 

Farmer in Percy Township. 
  
 John: 
 1871: Family lived in Percy Township, Northumberland County, Ontario. 
 
    Children: 
 
    29. i. Sarah Cummings #75004 b. c. 1856. 
 
    30. ii. Harriet (Hattie) Cummings #75006 b. c. 1857. 
 
    31. iii. George Cummings #75003 b. c. 1860. 
 
    32. iv. John Cummings #75008 b. c. 1862. 
 
    33. v. Elahanan Cummings #192798 b. c. 1863. 
 
    34. vi. Mary Cummings #75011 b. c. 1865. 
 
    35. vii. Charlotte Cummings #192797 b. c. 1868. 
 
    36. viii. Alice Cummings #75007 b. c. 1870. 
 
    37. ix. Althena Cummings #75009. 
 
    38. x. Frank Cummings #75010. 
 
    39. xi. Henry Cummings #75005. 
 
    40. xii. Helen Cummings #75012. 
 
    41. xiii. Mabel Cummings #75013. 
 
10. Emily Boulter #75014, b. c. 01 November 1835 in Prince Edward County, Ontario,13,14,15 d. 19 February 1919 in Lot 

68, 90, Con. 1, Albury, Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,13 buried in Albury Cemetery, Ameliasburgh, 
Prince Edward County, Ontario.13,14 . 

 
 She married William Ryerson Dempsey #75015, 16 July 1856,1 b. 04 October 1832 in Prince Edward County, 

Ontario,16,14 (son of William T. Dempsey #113931 [Farmer in Ameliasburgh] and Sarah Ann Mikel #113932), 
occupation 1870 Farmer in Albury, d. 13 February 1914 in Lot 89/90, Con. 1, Albury, Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward 
County, Ontario,14,17 buried in Albury Church Cemetery, Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario.14,17 
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 William: 
 Lived in Ameliasburgh. Ten children, two died in infancy. Link to parents based on consecutive enumerations in the 

1871 Ameliasburgh census... verify! 
 1871: Lived in Ameliasburgh with family; servant Catherine ROBISON, 17, Domestic Servant lived with the family. 
  
 1901: Family lived in Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario. 
 
    Children: 
 
    42. i. George Egerton Ross Dempsey #146477 b. 1857. 
 
    43. ii. Reginald Dempsey #75016. 
 
    44. iii. Annie Marie Dempsey #75017 b. 1859. 
 
    45. iv. William Charles Dempsey #75020 b. 06 July 1861. 
 
    46. v. Florence Emily Dempsey #112926 b. 31 July 1864. 
 
    47. vi. Sarah Letitia Dempsey #75022 b. 05 June 1866. 
 
    48. vii. Mary Elizabeth Dempsey #75019 b. 22 July 1870. 
 
    49. viii. Mark Ryerson Dempsey #87938 b. 22 July 1870. 
 
    50. ix. Alice Helen Dempsey #75021 b. 02 May 1871. 
 
    51. x. Henry Ryerson (Harry) Dempsey #75023 b. 22 September 1876. 
 
11. Wellington Boulter #74995, b. c. 14 February 1838 in Ontario,18,19 occupation 1871 - 1921 Farmer in Hallowell 

Township, religion 1871 Presbyterian, d. 27 February 1927 in Prince Edward County, Ontario,19 buried in Glenwood 
Cemetery, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario.19 . 

  
  
 Wellington was the 10th of 21 children by father George BOULTER (and two wives) 
 1871: Lived with family in Sophiasburgh Township. Emily BOULTER, 55, unmarried was enumerated with the family. 
  
 1901: Family lived in Sophiasburgh. Father-in-law Stephen SPRAGUE, cousin Porter DORRIE, 12 AUG 1833, Quebec 

lived with the family. 
 Moved to Picton. 
 
 He married Nancy Helen Sprague #72374, 10 October 1861 in Demorestville, Prince Edward County, Ontario,20 b. 

c. 01 April 1843 in Thurlow, Hastings County, Upper Canada,21,19 (daughter of Stephen Sprague #69738 
[Cabinetmaker in Sidney Township] and Patience Thompson #69739), d. May 1918 in Hallowell Township, Prince 
Edward County, Ontario,19 buried in Glenwood Cemetery, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario.19 

 
    Children: 
 
    52. i. Clara Belle Boulter #74997 b. c. 08 October 1862. 
 
    53. ii. George Edward Boulter #74999 b. 26 October 1865. 
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    54. iii. Frank Ernest Napier Boulter #75000 b. 21 September 1868. 
 
    55. iv. Helen Louise Boulter #74996 b. 01 August 1873. 
 
    56. v. John (James?) Henry (Wellington) Boulter #74998 b. 12 January 1877. 
 
    57. vi. Lillian Leone Boulter #75024 b. 21 February 1882. 
 
12. Collingwood Boulter #75025, b. c. June 1840 in Ontario, occupation 1900 Cattle Raiser in Cheyenne, Wyoming, 

occupation 1910 Rooming House Operator in Cheyenne. 
  
  
 Emigrated from Canada to the United States 
 1900: Lived with wife Ellen and her sister, Mary Ann in Cheyenne 
 1920: Widowed, lived with Mary A. DONOHUE, sister of his late wife in Cheyenne, Laramie County, Wyoming. 
 
 He married Ellen E. Donohue #75026,1 b. c. November 1849 in Massachusetts, United States,22 (daughter of 

(unidentified) Donohue #192861 and (unidentified) #192862), d. before 1920 in Cheyenne? 
  
 Ellen: 
 (Parents born in England, 1900 Wyoming census). 
 
13. Edward Boulter #75031, b.1 occupation Soldier, US Federal Army, d. 1861 - 1865 in American Civil war.1 . 
  
  
 Joined US Federal Army and was killed in the Civil War. 
  
14. Maria Boulter #75027, b. c. 1843 in Ontario,1,4 d. 1874 in Belleville, Hastings County, Ontario,23 buried in Belleville 

Cemetery, Belleville, Hastings County, Ontario.23 . 
 
 She married Donald Graham #75028, 18 December 1869 in Hastings County, Ontario,24 b. c. 1836 in Islay, 

Scotland,25 (son of Duncan Graham #192866 and Ann (unidentified) #192867), occupation 1871 General Trader in 
Belleville, occupation 1907 Commission Merchant in Belleville, d. 09 April 1907 in Charles Street, Belleville, Hastings 
County, Ontario,25 buried in Belleville Cemetery, Belleville, Hastings County, Ontario.23 

  
 Donald: 
 1871: Couple lived in Belleville with servant Mary MCARTHUR; no children present. 
  
 Donald was shown as being married at his death in 1907. 
 
    Children: 
 
    58. i. Annie E. Graham #75029. 
 
    59. ii. Islay Graham #75030 b. 1874. 
 
15. Wilson Boulter #75033, b. c. December 1849 in Ontario,4,26 occupation 1871 Clerk, Belleville Post Office, 

occupation 1900 Clerk in Chicago, occupation 1910 Clerk in Grocery Store, Chicago. 
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 1880: Immigrated to the United States of America, settled in Chicago, Illinois. 
 1910: Lived at 521 1/2 East 41st Street, Chicago with wife Augusta, boarder Hattie HANSON. No children. 
 
 He married Augusta (unidentified) #75034,1 b. c. January 1854 in Sweden,26 occupation 1910 Teacher, Service of 

Healing? 
  
 Augusta: 
 (both parents born in Sweden). 
 
16. Franklin (Frank) Boulter #75035, b. c. 1852 in Ontario,4 occupation 1871 Telegraph Operator in Belleville, 

occupation 1910 Accountant in Omaha, Nebraska, d. 15 December 1940 in San Diego, San Diego County, California, 
USA,27 buried Cypress View Mausoleum and Crematory, San Diego, California.28 . 

  
  
 1910: Family lived at 1019 North 40th Street, Omaha, Nebraska 
 Lived in Omaha, Nebraska, moved to San Diego in 1913. 
 1920: Family lived at 3365 Front Street, San Diego, California. 
 1926: Informant at brother Nelson's death, lived at 4119 Palmetto Avenue, San Francisco, California. 
 
 He married Helen T. (unidentified) #192869, b. c. 1868 in New Mexico, United States of America.29 
  
 Helen: 
 (Father born Pennsylvania, mother in New York State; 1920 Sand Diego Census). 
 
    Children: 
 
    60. i. Howard Thornton Boulter #192870 b. c. 1908. 
 
17. Alice Boulter #192864, b. c. 1853 in Ontario,4 religion 1881 Presbyterian. 
 
 She married James Henry Stewart #192872, b. c. 1845 in Ontario,30 occupation 1881 - 1891 Banker in Trenton, 

religion 1881 Presbyterian. 
  
 James: 
 1881: Couple lived in Trenton, no children. 
 1891: Family lived in Trenton; two children. James' parents were both born in Scotland. 
 
    Children: 
 
    61. i. Irene Stewart #192873 b. c. 1886. 
 
    62. ii. Elsie Infield Stewart #192874 b. c. 1888. 
 
18. Florence Boulter #192865, b. c. 26 December 1855 in Ontario,4,31 d. 07 July 1946 in San Diego, San Diego, 

California, USA.31 . 
  
  
 1930: Lived with brother Franklin and family in San Diego, California. 
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 She married Cassius M. Loomis #192871, 21 October 1900 in Chicago, Cook County, Illinois, USA,32 b. c. 1846 in 
New York State, USA,33 occupation 1910 Print Shop Owner in Chicago, Illinois, occupation 1920 Practitioner, 
Christian Services, d. before 1930 in United States. 

  
 Cassius: 
 1910: Family lived on Oakwood Boulevard, Chicago, Illinois. Florence's sister Marion was enumerated with the 

family. 
 1920: Family lived at 437 Grand View Street, Los Angeles, California. Annie E. GRAHAM was living with the family. 

She is show as a niece, but was the daughter of Donald GRAHAM and Maria BOULTER. 
 
19. Marion Boulter #75036, b. c. 1858 in Ontario.1,4 . 
  
  
 1910: Lived with her sister Florence and husband Cassius LOOMIS in Chicago, Illinois. 
 1920L Lived  at State Hospital, Eldridge, Sonoma County, California. 
  
20. Wallace Boulter #75037, b. c. 1860 in Ontario,1,4 occupation 1880 Coachman in Walworth, Wisconsin. 
  
  
 Unmarried; settled in Chicago, IL.  (Pioneer Life) 
 1880: lived in Walworth, Wisconsin, USA 
  
21. Nelson Boulter #75032, b. 14 February 1847 in Demorestville, Prince Edward County, Ontario,34,35 never married, 

occupation 1900 Farmer in Kibbey, Montana, d. 01 March 1926 in Warm Springs, Deer Lodge, Montana, USA,35 
occupation 1926 Rancher in Cascade County, Montana, buried 04 March 1926 in Montana State Hospital Cemetery, 
Warm Springs, Montana.35 . 

  
  
 1860: Lived with family in Belleville. Younger brother Collingwood was also enumerated with the family. 
 Settled in Cheyenne, USA 
  
 

Generation Four 
 

22. Sarah Leticia Boulter #74976, b. 26 October 1848 in Sophiasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,1,36,37,38 
occupation Housewife, d. 15 March 1922 in Milford, South Marysburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,37 buried 17 
March 1922 in Cherry Valley Cemetery, Athol Township, Prince Edward County, Ontario.37 . 

 
 She married Simon Aylsworth Cole #75038, b. c. 1846 in Big Island, Sophiasburgh, Prince Edward County, 

Ontario,36,38 (son of Simon Cole #92086 and Elizabeth Doxsee #92087), occupation 1871 - 1878 Farmer in Big Island, 
Sophiasburgh, occupation 1881 Farmer in South Marysburgh, d. 1922.39 

  
 Simon: 
 Family lived in Marysburgh, Prince Edward County. 
 1878: Family  lived in Sophiasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario. 
 1881: Family lived in South Marysburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario. Maggie KING, 18, born England; Thomas 

ROUSSEAU, 23, born Quebec lived with the family. 
 
    Children: 
 
    63. i. Claude Wilmot (King) Cole #75039 b. 14 October 1870. 
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    64. ii. Mary Edna Cole #75040 b. 08 January 1873. 
 
    65. iii. George Aylsworth Cole #75041 b. 01 January 1876. 
 
    66. iv. Arthur Boulter Cole #75042 b. 01 December 1877. 
 
    67. v. Jesse Abbot Cole #75043 b. 24 November 1879. 
 
23. Mary Emma Boulter #74979, b. c. 1844 - 1853 in Demorestville, Prince Edward County, Ontario.6 . 
 
 She married William A. Anderson #104736, 17 May 1876 in Big Island, Sophiasburgh, Prince Edward County, 

Ontario,40 b. c. 1846 in Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario, occupation 1881 Farmer in Ameliasburgh. 
  
 William: 
 1881: Family lived in Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario. 
 
    Children: 
 
    68. i. Jennie Anderson #97523 b. 28 April 1880. 
 
24. George Henry Boulter #74977, b. c. 26 February 1850 in Ontario,1,6 religion 1878 Presbyterian, occupation 1871 - 

1894 Farmer in Big Island,  Sophiasburgh, occupation 1880 Band Master in Picton, d. 20 July 1932 in Hastings, 
Northumberland County, Ontario,41 buried in Glenwood Cemetery, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario.41 . 

  
  
 Family lived on Big Island, Sophiasburgh, Prince Edward County. 
 
 He married Georgiana Jeffery #75044, 16 January 1878 in Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario,1 b. c. 1858 in 

Canada West (daughter of George Jeffery #91376 [Butcher in Picton] and Eliza Cole #91377), religion 1878 Church 
of England, d. 1940 in Picton?,42 buried in Glenwood Cemetery, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario. 

  
 Georgiana: 
 Family lived on Big Island. 
 1861: Not seen in 1861 Picton census? 
 1878: Lived in Picton when married. 
 
    Children: 
 
    69. i. Luella Maude Boulter #75045 b. 24 December 1878. 
 
    70. ii. Beatrice Lena Boulter #93545 b. 14 April 1880. 
 
    71. iii. Ralph Clarke Boulter #75047 b. c. 1884. 
 
    72. iv. Norman Sills Boulter #75048 b. 14 September 1894. 
 
    73. v. Ilah Boulter #75049 b. 15 October 1890. 
 
    74. vi. Donah (Donald?) Havelock Boulter #75050 b. 04 May 1897. 
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    75. vii. Donah S. Boulter #75051 b. 15 October 1890. 
 
    76. viii. (unidentified) Boulter #75052. 
 
    77. ix. (unidentified) Boulter #75053. 
 
    78. x. (unidentified) Boulter #75054. 
 
    79. xi. Donnah Sophia Boulter #207682 b. 14 February 1901. 
 
25. Charles Wilson Boulter #74978, b. c. 1855 in Ontario.1,6 . 
  
  
 Family settled in Michigan (Pioneer Life). 
 
 He married Jennie Hatfield #75055.1 
  
 Jennie: 
 Family lived in Michigan. 
 
    Children: 
 
    80. i. Florence Boulter #75056. 
 
    81. ii. Mary E. Boulter #75057. 
 
    82. iii. James Albert Boulter #148550 b. c. 08 May 1883. 
 
26. James Havelock Boulter #74980, b. c. 1864 in Prince Edward County, Ontario,1,6 d. in youth.1 . 
  
  
 Died in youth, accidental drowning. 
  
27. Frederick Albert Boulter #110358, b. c. 1870 * in Demorestville, Prince Edward County, Ontario, occupation 1895 

Canner in Demorestville, occupation 1895 Commercial Traveller in Toronto, occupation 1900 Repairer in Soda Ash 
Works in Syracuse, occupation 1921 Manufacturer, Tin Works in Toronto. 

  
  
 1895: Lived in Toronto when married. 
 1900: Family lived at 615 Turtle Street, Syracuse, New York. Birth date shown as July 1864 on census. 
 1921: Family lived in Toronto, York County. 
 1935: Lived at 589 Markham Street, Toronto; Informant at wife's death. 
 
 He married Elizabeth (Lizzie) Olive Smith #105394, 22 January 1895 in Toronto, York County, Ontario,43 b. August 

1870 in Sophiasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,6,44 (daughter of Samuel N. Smith #92903 [Miller and Farmer 
in Sophiasburgh] and Olive A. Wee #92904), d. 14 September 1935 in 589 Markham Street, Toronto, York County, 
Ontario,45 buried 17 September 1935 in Glenwood Cemetery, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario.45,44 

  
 Elizabeth: 
 1935: Death record shows birthdate of 28 July... 
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    Children: 
 
    83. i. William Anderson Boulter #75059 b. 21 February 1895. 
 
    84. ii. James Nathaniel Boulter #75060 b. c. July 1897. 
 
28. Florence Boulter #74987, b. c. August 1859 in Ontario,1,46 religion 1880 Presbyterian. 
 
 She married George A. Skinner #75061, 19 May 1880 in Hastings County, Ontario,47 b. c. February 1850 in England 

(son of Henry E. Skinner #192889 and Eliza Mann #192890), occupation 1880 Lawyer in Stirling, Hastings County, 
Ontario, occupation 1900 Lawyer in Los Angeles, California, occupation 1910 Attorney in Long Beach, California, 
religion 1880 Church of England. 

  
 George: 
 1880: Lived in Stirling, Hastings County, Ontario when married. 
  
 1900: Family lived at 332 West 28th Street, Los Angeles, California.. 
 1910: Family lived at 711 Elm Avenue, Long Beach, California. 
 
    Children: 
 
    85. i. Reginald B. Skinner #75062 b. c. September 1882. 
 
    86. ii. Gerald A. Skinner #75063 b. c. March 1884. 
 
    87. iii. Robert Everett E. Skinner #75064 b. c. April 1886. 
 
    88. iv. Georgina (Georgie) F.M. Skinner #75065 b. c. August 1890. 
 
29. Sarah Cummings #75004, b. c. 1856 in Ontario.1,12 . 
30. Harriet (Hattie) Cummings #75006, b. c. 1857 in Ontario.1,12 . 
31. George Cummings #75003, b. c. 1860 in Ontario.12 . 
32. John Cummings #75008, b. c. 1862 in Ontario.1,12 . 
33. Elahanan Cummings #192798, b. c. 1863 in Ontario.12 . 
34. Mary Cummings #75011, b. c. 1865 in Ontario.1,12 . 
35. Charlotte Cummings #192797, b. c. 1868 in Percy Township, Northumberland County, Ontario.12 . 
36. Alice Cummings #75007, b. c. 1870 in Percy Township, Northumberland County, Ontario,1,12 occupation 1891 Music 

Teacher in Percy Township. 
37. Althena Cummings #75009, b.1. 
38. Frank Cummings #75010, b.1. 
39. Henry Cummings #75005, b.1. 
40. Helen Cummings #75012, b.1. 
41. Mabel Cummings #75013, b.1. 
42. George Egerton Ross Dempsey #146477, b. 1857 in Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,16,14 d. 1883,14 

buried in Albury Church Cemetery, Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario.14 . 
 
 
43. Reginald Dempsey #75016, b. in Ameliasburgh.1 . 
44. Annie Marie Dempsey #75017, b. 1859 in Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,1,14 d. 1869 in 

Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,14 buried in Albury Church Cemetery, Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward 
County, Ontario.14 . 
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45. William Charles Dempsey #75020, b. 06 July 1861 in Ameliasburgh Township, Prince Edward County, Ontario,1,48,16 
baptized 06 November 1862 in Ameliasburgh Township, Prince Edward County, Ontario,48 occupation 1906 - 1921 
Farmer in Ameliasburgh, d. 10 December 1941 in Ontario Hospital, Kingston, Frontenac County, Ontario,49 buried 
December 1941 in Belleville Cemetery, Belleville, Hastings County, Ontario.49,23 . 

  
  
 1891: Family lived in Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario. No children present. 
 1901 - 1921:  Family in Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario 
 1941: Usual address at death: RR #1, Belleville (Ameliasburgh),. 
 
 He married Lorena Smith #192799, 05 February 1891 in Lockport, New York, USA,50 b. 1864 in Ontario,23 d. 1956 in 

Belleville?,23 buried in Belleville Cemetery, Belleville, Hastings County, Ontario.23 
  
 Lorena: 
 Lorena's parents both born in the United States (1921 Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario census) 
 1841: William's next-of-kin  from his death record shown as Mrs. Wm. C. DEMPSEY, 544 Christie Street, Toronto. 
 
    Children: 
 
    89. i. Evelyn A. Dempsey #192801 b. c. 15 March 1898. 
 
    90. ii. William Allan Dempsey #192800 b. 17 August 1906. 
 
46. Florence Emily Dempsey #112926, b. 31 July 1864 in Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,48 baptized 06 

November 1864 in Ameliasburgh Township, Prince Edward County, Ontario,48 d. 1951 in Ameliasburgh, Prince 
Edward County, Ontario,51 buried in Albury Church Cemetery, Albury, Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, 
Ontario.51 . 

 
 She married Herman/Henan Burnett Woodrow #112925, 18 September 1886 in Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward 

County, Ontario,52 b. c. 1863 in Athol Township, Prince Edward County, Ontario (son of John W. Woodrow 
#101866 [Farmer in Athol Township] and Adelaide Williams #101867 [Housewife in Athol Township]), occupation 
1886 - 1887 Yeoman/Farmer in Athol Township, d. 18 March 1925 in Toronto General Hospital, Toronto, York 
County, Ontario.53 

 
    Children: 
 
    91. i. Gerald Douglas Woodrow #149910 b. c. 1897. 
 
    92. ii. Reginald Wallace (William) Woodrow #163989 b. 25 July 1887. 
 
47. Sarah Letitia Dempsey #75022, b. 05 June 1866 in Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,1,48,16,14 baptized 27 

July 1870 in Ameliasburgh Township, Prince Edward County, Ontario,48 d. 02 June 1904 in Ameliasburgh, Prince 
Edward County, Ontario,14,51 buried in Albury Church Cemetery, Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario.14 . 

  
  
 Sarah is shown as five years old in the 1871 Ameliasburgh census... 
 1901: Lived with parents in Ameliasburgh, 
  
48. Mary Elizabeth Dempsey #75019, b. 22 July 1870 in Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,1,54,48 baptized 27 

July 1870 in Ameliasburgh Township, Prince Edward County, Ontario.48 . 
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 She married Charles Edward Way #162546, 30 August 1893 in Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,55 b. 
c. 1855 in Sophiasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario (son of Philip Way #162547 and Mary Drewry #173677), 
occupation 1893 - 1894 Farmer in Northport. 

  
 Charles: 
 1908: Informant at mother's death in Sophiasburgh. 
 
    Children: 
 
    93. i. Helen Letta Way #175119 b. 02 June 1894. 
 
    94. ii. Gladys Marjorie Way #175717 b. 22 May 1898. 
 
    95. iii. Hilda Lorena Way #207686 b. 13 March 1901. 
 
    96. iv. Gena Merle Way #208588 b. 18 November 1907. 
 
49. Mark Ryerson Dempsey #87938, b. 22 July 1870 in Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario.,56 d. 1870 in 

Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,14 buried in Albury Church Cemetery, Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward 
County, Ontario.14 . 

50. Alice Helen Dempsey #75021, b. 02 May 1871 in Ameliasburgh Township, Prince Edward County, Ontario,1,48 
baptized 01 September 1872 in Ameliasburgh Township, Prince Edward County, Ontario.48 . 

  
  
 1901: Lived with family in Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario. 
  
51. Henry Ryerson (Harry) Dempsey #75023, b. 22 September 1876 in Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, 

Ontario,1,57 d. 27 December 1948 in Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,51,58 buried 30 December 1948 
in Albury Church Cemetery, Albury, Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario.51,58 . 

  
  
 1901: Lived with wife at home of family in Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario. 
 
 He married (1) Josephine Summer Dakin #192802, b. c. 08 May 1881 - 1882 in Ontario,15 d. 1915 in Ameliasburgh, 

Prince Edward County, Ontario, buried in Albury Church Cemetery, Albury, Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, 
Ontario. 

 
    Children: 
 
    97. i. Ronald Dempsey #247882. 
 
 He married (2) Cora B. Carney #149875, b. 1877,59 d. 1951 in Ameliasburgh,59 buried in Albury Church Cemetery, 

Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario.59 
 
52. Clara Belle Boulter #74997, b. c. 08 October 1862 in Demorestville?,18,60 d. 23 March 1941 in Picton, Prince Edward 

County, Ontario,61,60 buried 26 March 1941 in Glenwood Cemetery, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario.61,60 . 
  
  
 Informant/Witness for younger sister Helen's delayed birth registration. 
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 She married Edward Malcolm Young #75066, 18 July 1887 in Sophiasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,62 b. c. 
08 January 1856 in Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,61,63 (son of Oliver Cromwell Young #73916 
[Farmer in Ameliasburgh] and Jane Parliament #73917), occupation 1887 Barrister in Picton, County Clerk, d. 28 
October 1936 in Toronto General Hospital, Toronto, York County, Ontario,61,63 buried 30 October 1936 in Glenwood 
Cemetery, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario.61,63 

  
 Edward: 
 1897: Called to the Bar, practised law in Picton from 1897 until his death. 
 1921: Family lived at 65 Bridge Street, Picton. 
 
    Children: 
 
    98. i. Helen Bernice Boulter Young #75067 b. 23 January 1892. 
 
53. George Edward Boulter #74999, b. 26 October 1865 in Demorestville, Sophiasburgh, Prince Edward County, 

Ontario,18,61 occupation 1893 Farmer in Sophiasburgh, occupation 1895 - 1898 Manufacturer in Picton, d. 28 
February 1935 in Centre Street, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario,61,64 buried 02 March 1935 in Glenwood 
Cemetery, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario.61,64 . 

  
  
 1911: Family lived in Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario. 
 1935: Fell of a box onto a cement floor in canning factory which resulted in his death. 
 
 He married Helen Blanche (Nellie) German #75068, 11 January 1893 in Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario,65 b. 

c. June 1865 - 1867 in Hillier Township, Prince Edward County,66 (daughter of William Peter German #72200 
[Labourer in Hillier Township] and Mary Catherine Sprague #136948 [Housewife]), d. September 1951 in Picton, 
Prince Edward County, Ontario,61 buried in Glenwood Cemetery, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario.61 

  
 Helen: 
 1893: Lived in Picton when married. Confirm link to parents... 
 
    Children: 
 
    99. i. (unidentified) Boulter #75071. 
 
    100. ii. (unidentified) Boulter #75072. 
 
    101. iii. Alice Boulter #174375 b. 13 February 1895. 
 
    102. iv. Leland Wellington Boulter #75069 b. 01 February 1897. 
 
    103. v. Helen Kathryn Boulter #144672 b. 09 September 1898. 
 
54. Frank Ernest Napier Boulter #75000, b. 21 September 1868 in Demorestville, Prince Edward County, Ontario,18 

occupation 1898 Manufacturer in Picton, occupation 1909 Government Inspector in Detroit, d. 05 April 1909 in 
Grace Hospital, Detroit, Michigan, USA,67 buried Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario.67 . 

  
  
 1901: Lived in Picton with wife Gertrude (Bongard). 
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 He married Ida Gertrude Bongard #135506, 09 March 1898 in St. James Presbyterian, Toronto, York County, 
Ontario,1,68 b. c. 1874 in Cressy, North Marysburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,69 (daughter of John Nelson 
Bongard #106177 [Farmer in  North Marysburgh] and Emma Louisa Wright #135504). 

  
 Ida: 
 1898: Lived in Toronto when married. 
 1911: Census shows Ida living with her parents in Picton, noted as being single... 
 
55. Helen Louise Boulter #74996, b. 01 August 1873 in Demorestville, Sophiasburgh, Prince Edward County,70 d. 1956 

in Ontario,61 buried in Glenwood Cemetery, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario.61 . 
  
  
 1921: Lived with widowed father and siblings in Hallowell Township, Prince Edward County, Ontario. Not married. 
 1841: Informant at sister Clara's death, lived in Picton. 
 
 She married Freeman Kerr Albertson #192822, 19 April 1922 in Detroit, Wayne County, Michigan, USA,71 b. c. 12 

February 1861 in Vienna, Warren County, New Jersey, USA,61 (son of Coursen Albertson #192894 and Clarissa 
White #192895), occupation 1922 Sales Manager in Detroit, d. 1939 in Palm Beach, Florida, USA,61 buried in 
Glenwood Cemetery, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario,61 occupation Granite Manufacturer in New York State. 

 
56. John (James?) Henry (Wellington) Boulter #74998, b. 12 January 1877 in Demorestville, Prince Edward County,72,19 

occupation 1921 Medical Doctor/Physician in Hallowell Township, d. June 1959 in Ontario, buried in Glenwood 
Cemetery, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario.19 . 

  
  
 1921: Lived with wife, children, father and siblings in Hallowell Township. 
 
 He married Evelyn Crawford #110063, b. September 1879 in Ontario,19,73 d. May 1943,19 buried in Glenwood 

Cemetery, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario.19 
 
    Children: 
 
    104. i. Frank Boulter #155649 b. c. 1913. 
 
    105. ii. Edward Malcolm Boulter #110064 b. August 1917. 
 
57. Lillian Leone Boulter #75024, b. 21 February 1882 in Sophiasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,1,74 d. 

September 1955 in Ontario,61 buried in Glenwood Cemetery, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario.61 . 
58. Annie E. Graham #75029, b.1. 
  
  
 1920: Lived with Cassius LOOMIS and aunt Florence M. BOULTER in Los Angeles, California, 
  
59. Islay Graham #75030, b. 1874 in Belleville, Hastings County, Ontario,1,23 d. 1874 in Belleville, Hastings County, 

Ontario.1,23 . 
60. Howard Thornton Boulter #192870, b. c. 1908 in Nebraska, United States,29 occupation 1930 Newspaper Reporter 

in San Diego.75 . 
61. Irene Stewart #192873, b. c. 1886 in Trenton, Hastings County, Ontario.76 . 
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 She married Frederic Scholz Wilkins #192880, 28 April 1909 in Trenton, Hastings County, Ontario,77 b. c. 1881 in 
Ontario (son of William Thomas Wilkins #192881 [Clergyman] and Jessie Craig #192882), occupation 1909 
Secretary, occupation 1921 Engineer in Moncton, New Brunswick. 

  
 Frederic: 
 1921: Family lived in Moncton, New Brunswick. 
 
    Children: 
 
    106. i. Elizabeth Wilkins #192883 b. c. 1910. 
 
    107. ii. Stewart Wilkins #192884 b. c. 1912. 
 
    108. iii. John Wilkins #192885 b. c. 1916. 
 
62. Elsie Infield Stewart #192874, b. c. 1888 in Trenton, Hastings County, Ontario. 
 
 She married Alexander Nelms Denyes #192875, 04 July 1906 in East Toronto, York County, Ontario,78 b. c. 1886 in 

Trenton, Hastings County, Ontario (son of Wilmot Denyes #192876 and Sarah Boulton #192877), occupation 1906 
Bank Clerk in East Toronto. 

  
 Alexander: 
 1909: Family lived in Phillipsville, Leeds and Grenville, Ontario. 
 
 

Generation Five 
 

63. Claude Wilmot (King) Cole #75039, b. 14 October 1870 in South Marysburgh?, Prince Edward County, Ontario,36,38,79 
occupation 1890 Farmer in South Marysburgh, d. 13 May 1938 in Watertown, Jefferson County, New York State,80 
buried in Glenwood Cemetery, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario.80 . 

  
  
 Birthplace more likely Sophiasburgh.. 
 1930: Lived in Cape Vincent with family; brother-in-law Clarence ACKERMAN, widowed,  lived with the family. 
 1937: Informant at brother Jesse's death; lived in Cape Vincent, New York.. 
 
 He married Sarah Anne (Annie) Dodge #87575, 11 December 1890 in Milford, South Marysburgh, Prince Edward 

County, Ontario,81 b. 05 July 1871 in Milford, South Marysburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,82 (daughter of 
Frederick Dodge #87042 [Labourer in South Marysburgh] and Eliza Thompson #87043), d. 25 January 1947 in Mill 
Street, Deseronto, Hastings County, Ontario,83 buried 27 January 1947 in Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario.83 

 
    Children: 
 
    109. i. Wilmot Havelock Cole #117616 b. 22 March 1892. 
 
    110. ii. Cecil Aylsworth Cole #117614 b. 06 June 1897. 
 
64. Mary Edna Cole #75040, b. 08 January 1873 in Sophiasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,1,84 occupation 

Housewife, d. 21 September 1929 in 211 Drew Street, Oshawa, Ontario,85 buried 23 September 1929 in Picton, 
Prince Edward County, Ontario.85 . 
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 She married Clarence Finley Ackerman #83145, 1904 in Wetaskiwin, Alberta, Canada,86 b. 04 March 1883 in South 
Marysburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,87,88 (son of Alva Franklin Ackerman #79660 [Farmer in South 
Marysburgh] and Addie (Ada) L. Spafford #83140), d. 19 November 1980.39 

  
 Clarence: 
 1906 -1921: Lived in Alberta 
 About 1926, returned to Ontario and settled at 211 Drew Street, Oshawa. 
 1930: Enumerated with brother-in-law Claude COLE in St. Vincent, New York. 
 
    Children: 
 
    111. i. Clifford McLaren Ackerman #83146 b. 31 July 1906. 
 
65. George Aylsworth Cole #75041, b. 01 January 1876 in South Marysburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,1,89 

occupation 1900 Farmer in Frontenac County, d. 1939 in Prince Edward County, Ontario,90 buried in Cherry Valley 
Cemetery, Athol Township, Prince Edward County, Ontario.90 . 

  
  
 1936: Informant at wife Nellie's death, lived in South Bay. 
 
 He married Nellie May Keys #117636, 11 December 1900 in Wolfe Island, Frontenac County, Ontario,91 b. c. 27 

March 1876 in Ontario,92 (daughter of Thomas Keys #104729 and Lucy Bullis? #104730), occupation Housewife in 
South Marysburgh, d. 03 January 1936 in South Marysburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,92 buried 05 January 
1936 in Cherry Valley United Church Cemetery, Athol Township, Prince Edward County, Ontario.92 

 
    Children: 
 
    112. i. Helen B. Cole #117633 b. c. 1902. 
 
    113. ii. Lena Bernice Cole #207862 b. 13 March 1902. 
 
    114. iii. Doris Catherine Cole #109867 b. 05 August 1916. 
 
    115. iv. Aylsworth Cole #117635. 
 
    116. v. Norma A. Cole #109015 b. 1917. 
 
66. Arthur Boulter Cole #75042, b. 01 December 1877 in Sophiasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario.1,93 . 
  
  
 Settled near Camrose, Alberta. 
 
 He married Olive Smith #117612.39 
 
    Children: 
 
    117. i. Lettie Cole #117639. 
 
    118. ii. Alice Cole #117640. 
 
    119. iii. Edna Cole #117641. 
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    120. iv. Hazel Cole #117642. 
 
    121. v. Richard Cole #117643. 
 
    122. vi. Claude Cole #117644. 
 
    123. vii. Jesse Cole #117645. 
 
67. Jesse Abbot Cole #75043, b. 24 November 1879 in Sophiasburgh Township, Prince Edward County, Ontario,1,94 

occupation 1937 Farmer in Athol Township, d. 27 December 1937 in South Marysburgh, Prince Edward County, 
Ontario,95 buried 29 December 1937 in Cherry Valley Cemetery, Athol Township, Prince Edward County.95 . 

  
  
 1922: Informant at mother's death; lived in Cherry Valley. 
 
 He married Alta Theresa Viale #117613, 22 June 1909 in Oakland, Alameda County, California,96,97 b. 24 July 1892 

in California,39 d. after 1937. 
 
    Children: 
 
    124. i. Hazel Annie Cole #117646 b. 27 July 1910. 
 
    125. ii. Edna Kathleen Cole #109013 b. 08 June 1913. 
 
    126. iii. Murney Nelson Cole #109014 b. 1912. 
 
68. Jennie Anderson #97523, b. 28 April 1880 in Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario.98 . 
69. Luella Maude Boulter #75045, b. 24 December 1878 in Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario,1,99 d. infancy.1 . 
70. Beatrice Lena Boulter #93545, b. 14 April 1880 in Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario,100 d. 20 June 1952 in 

Grosse Pointe, Wayne County, Michigan, USA,101 buried in Forest Lawn Cemetery, Detroit, Wayne County, 
Michigan, USA.102 . 

  
  
 1921: Divorced from second husband Wesley SCHRAM on grounds of "extreme and repeated cruelty". 
 
 She married (1) Andrew M. Vancleaf #93544, 14 September 1898 in Big Island, Prince Edward County, Ontario,103 

b. 28 February 1876 in Bloomfield, Prince Edward County, Ontario,104 (son of Daniel Vancleaf #86068 [Farmer in 
Hallowell Township] and Phoebe Ann Dorland #74343), occupation 1898 Farmer in Hallowell Township, occupation 
Veterinary Surgeon, d. 1949,105 buried in Glenwood Cemetery, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario.105  They 
were divorced. 

 
  
 She married (2) Wesley B. Schram #119934, 17 April 1902 in Windsor, Essex County,  Ontario, b. c. 1878 * in 

Canada,106 occupation 1920 Theatre Manager in Detroit, d. 23 June 1957 in Wayne County, Michigan, USA,107 
buried in Woodmere Cemetery, Detroit, Wayne County, Michigan, USA.107  They were divorced on 05 December 
1921 in Detroit, Wayne County, Michigan, USA.108 

 
    Children: 
 
    127. i. Norman Edward Schram #119935 b. 26 May 1904. 
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71. Ralph Clarke Boulter #75047, b. c. 1884 in Fairport, New York, USA,1 occupation 1907 Farmer in Northport. 
 
 He married Mabel N. Moran #125564, 30 October 1907 in Big Island, Sophiasburgh Township, Prince Edward 

County, Ontario,109 b. c. 1883 in Big Island, Sophiasburgh Township, Prince Edward County, Ontario (daughter of 
Hiram Nelson Moran #98701 [Farmer in Sophiasburgh] and Nettie Welsh #98702), occupation 1907 School Teacher 
in Big Island. 

 
    Children: 
 
    128. i. Bernard Moran Boulter #207024 b. 19 July 1908. 
 
72. Norman Sills Boulter #75048, b. 14 September 1894 in Sophiasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario.110 . 
73. Ilah Boulter #75049, b. 15 October 1890 in Sophiasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario.111 . 
74. Donah (Donald?) Havelock Boulter #75050, b. 04 May 1897 in Prince Edward County, Ontario,112 d. infancy.1 . 
75. Donah S. Boulter #75051, b. 15 October 1890 in Sophiasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,113 d. infancy?.1 . 
76. (unidentified) Boulter #75052, b.1 d. in infancy.1 . 
77. (unidentified) Boulter #75053, b.1 d. in infancy.1 . 
78. (unidentified) Boulter #75054, b.1 d. in infancy.1 . 
79. Donnah Sophia Boulter #207682, b. 14 February 1901 in Sophiasburgh Township, Prince Edward County, 

Ontario.114 . 
80. Florence Boulter #75056, b.1. 
81. Mary E. Boulter #75057, b.1. 
82. James Albert Boulter #148550, b. c. 08 May 1883 in Sophiasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario.115 . 
83. William Anderson Boulter #75059, b. 21 February 1895 in Toronto, York County, Ontario,116 occupation 1921 

Bookkeeper in Toronto. 
  
  
 18 MAR 1920: Arrived in Detroit, Michigan 
  
84. James Nathaniel Boulter #75060, b. c. July 1897 in Syracuse?, New York, USA,117 occupation 1926 Architect in 

Toronto, occupation 1921 Architectural Draftsman, religion 1926 Presbyterian. 
 
 He married Verena Furter #192886, 23 October 1926 in Toronto, York County, Ontario,118 b. c. 1902 in Ontario 

(daughter of Frederick Furter #192887 and Verena Heckler (Hachl) #192888), occupation 1926 Stenographer in 
Toronto, religion 1926 Presbyterian. 

 
85. Reginald B. Skinner #75062, b. c. September 1882 in Ontario,46 occupation 1900 Salesman in Los Angeles, 

occupation 1910 Dentist in Long Beach, California. 
86. Gerald A. Skinner #75063, b. c. March 1884 in Ontario,46 occupation 1900 Salesman in Los Angeles, occupation 

1910 Dry Goods Merchant in Long Beach. 
87. Robert Everett E. Skinner #75064, b. c. April 1886 in Ontario,46 occupation 1910 Motorman, Electric Railway in Long 

Beach. 
88. Georgina (Georgie) F.M. Skinner #75065, b. c. August 1890 in Ontario.46 . 
89. Evelyn A. Dempsey #192801, b. c. 15 March 1898 in Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario.15 . 
90. William Allan Dempsey #192800, b. 17 August 1906 in Ameliasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,119 d. 13 

March 1993 in Belleville?,23 buried in Belleville Cemetery, Belleville, Hastings County, Ontario.23 . 
  
  
 Gravestone shows that he claimed U.E. status. 
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 He married (1) Muriel E. Bentham #192806, b. 15 September 1906,23 d. 29 June 1947 in Belleville?,23 buried in 
Belleville Cemetery, Belleville, Hastings County, Ontario.23 

 
  
 He married (2) Ethel Agnes Noble #192803, 01 July 1948 in Merivale United Church, Ottawa, Ontario,120 b. 12 

November 1908 in Norval, Ontario,23,121 (daughter of Alexander L. Noble #192804 [Lieutenant-Colonel in Montreal] 
and Phoebe Elizabeth Arnott #192805), occupation Medical Doctor, F.R.C.P., d. 12 August 1995 in Belleville?,23 
buried in Belleville Cemetery, Belleville, Hastings County, Ontario.23 

  
 Ethel: 
 Verify mother to all children... 
 
    Children: 
 
    129. i. Lorena Ruth Dempsey #192807. 
 
    130. ii. Alice Elizabeth Dempsey #192809. 
 
    131. iii. W. Albert Dempsey #192811. 
 
    132. iv. Alexander Lawrence Dempsey #192813. 
 
91. Gerald Douglas Woodrow #149910, b. c. 1897 in Ontario, occupation 1926 Chauffeur and Mechanic in Toronto. 
  
  
 1925: Informant at father's death; lived on Millwood Road, Toronto. 
 1926: Lived at 55 Dupont Street, Toronto when married. 
 
 He married Vidia Gwendolyn Doane #149911, 26 June 1914 in Newmarket, North York, Ontario,122 b. c. 1899 in 

Ontario (daughter of Calvin D. Doane #149912 and Mary E. Riley #149913). 
  
 Vidia: 
 1926: Lived in Newmarket, Ontario when married. 
 
92. Reginald Wallace (William) Woodrow #163989, b. 25 July 1887 in Athol Township, Prince Edward County, 

Ontario.123 . 
  
  
 Name shown as "William" at birth (and on original birth record), but changed to "Reginald Wallace" on baptism, and 

on subsequent revised birth record dated 03 FEB 1894. 
  
93. Helen Letta Way #175119, b. 02 June 1894 in Sophiasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario.124 . 
94. Gladys Marjorie Way #175717, b. 22 May 1898 in Sophiasburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario.125 . 
95. Hilda Lorena Way #207686, b. 13 March 1901 in Sophiasburgh Township, Prince Edward County, Ontario.126 . 
96. Gena Merle Way #208588, b. 18 November 1907 in Lot 15, Con. 1, WGP, Sophiasburgh Township, Prince Edward 

County, Ontario.127 . 
97. Ronald Dempsey #247882. 
  
  
 (verify mother) 
 1948: Informant at father's death, lived in Carrying Place, Prince Edward County, Ontario 
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98. Helen Bernice Boulter Young #75067, b. 23 January 1892 in Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario,128 d. 1978 in 

Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario,129 buried in Glenwood Cemetery, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario.129 
. 

 
 She married John Stamford Warrington #192891, 06 June 1914 in Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario,130 b. c. 

1888 in Montreal, Quebec, Canada (son of John T. Warrington #192892 and Marie E.E. Nilson? #192893), 
occupation 1914 Architect in Toronto, d. 1964 in Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario,129 buried in Glenwood 
Cemetery, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario.129 

 
99. (unidentified) Boulter #75071, b.1 d. in infancy.1 . 
100. (unidentified) Boulter #75072, b.1 d. in infancy.1 . 
101. Alice Boulter #174375, b. 13 February 1895 in Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario,131 d. in infancy? . 
  
  
 Not seen with family 1900 -1911 
  
102. Leland Wellington Boulter #75069, b. 01 February 1897 in Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario,1 occupation 

Obstetrician and Gynecologist, d. 27 June 1978 in Victoria, British Columbia, Canada, buried in Christ Church 
Cathedral Columbarium, Victoria, British Columbia, Canada.132 . 

 
 He married Marjorie Miriam Phillips #192819, b. 13 March 1911 in London, England (daughter of James Phillips 

#192820 and Mary Evelyn King #192821), d. 30 January 1980 in Victoria, British Columbia, Canada,132 buried in 
Christ Church Cathedral Columbarium, Victoria, British Columbia, Canada.132 

 
103. Helen Kathryn Boulter #144672, b. 09 September 1898 in Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario,133 religion 1921 

Presbyterian. 
 
 She married William Rankin #144671, 31 August 1921 in St. Andrew's Church, Picton, Prince Edward County, 

Ontario,134 b. c. 1889 in Port Hope, Ontario (son of Robert Rankin #144674 [Sailor in Port Hope] and Helen Robina 
Liddell #144675), occupation 1921 Seedsman in Picton, religion 1921 Church of England. 

 
    Children: 
 
    133. i. William Herbert Boulter Rankin #144673 b. 07 February 1923. 
 
104. Frank Boulter #155649, b. c. 1913 in Prince Edward County, Ontario.73 . 
105. Edward Malcolm Boulter #110064, b. August 1917 in Prince Edward County, Ontario,19,73 d. December 2011,19 

buried19. 
 
 He married Joan Pearce #110065,19 b. August 1925.19 
 
106. Elizabeth Wilkins #192883, b. c. 1910 in Ontario.135 . 
107. Stewart Wilkins #192884, b. c. 1912 in Ontario.135 . 
108. John Wilkins #192885, b. c. 1916 in Moncton?, New Brunswick, Canada.135 . 
 

Generation Six 
 

109. Wilmot Havelock Cole #117616, b. 22 March 1892 in Milford, Prince Edward County, Ontario,136 occupation 1915 
Sailor in Cape Vincent, New York State, occupation Farmer in Deseronto, d. 28 December 1941 in Mill Street, 
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Deseronto, Tyendinaga Township, Hastings County,137 buried 30 December 1941 in Glenwood Cemetery, Picton, 
Prince Edward County, Ontario.137 . 

  
  
 1930: Lived with parents in Cape Vincent, New York. 
 
 He married (1) Grace May Bennett #117617, 23 November 1915 in Cape Vincent, Jefferson County, New York, 

USA,138 b. c. 1896 in Rensselaer Falls, New York, USA (daughter of Walter Bennett #144109 and Anna Charlesson 
#144110).  They were divorced before 1930. 

  
 Grace: 
 1920: Boarded with Noel BILLADOSE?, in Clifton, St. Lawrence County, NY. 
 
    Children: 
 
    134. i. Kathleen Cole #117619 b. 02 April 1917. 
 
 He married (2) Margaret Alice Mosedale #117618, b. c 1907,39 d. 09 December 1964.39 
  
 Margaret: 
 1941: Informant at husband's death; lived in Deseronto. 
 1947: Informant at mother-in-law's death, lived in Deseronto. 
 
    Children: 
 
    135. ii. Ronald Cole #117620. 
 
    136. iii. Davis Cole #117621. 
 
    137. iv. Donna Cole #117622. 
 
    138. v. Claudia Cole #117623. 
 
110. Cecil Aylsworth Cole #117614, b. 06 June 1897 in Prince Edward County, Ontario,139 d. 1941 in Picton?,140 buried 

in Glenwood Cemetery, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario.140 . 
 
 He married Edna Mary Zimmerman #117615, 12 June 1922 in Bloomfield, Hallowell Township, Prince Edward 

County, Ontario,141 b. 25 June 1899 in Waupoos, North Marysburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,140,142 
(daughter of William Edward Zimmerman #157207 [Farmer in Waupoos] and Annie May Leary #157208), d. 1946 
in Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario,140 buried in Glenwood Cemetery, Picton, Prince Edward County, 
Ontario.140 

 
111. Clifford McLaren Ackerman #83146, b. 31 July 1906 in Calgary, Alberta,143,144 occupation 1926 Fisherman in South 

Marysburgh, d. 1969 in Prince Edward County, Ontario,145 buried in Cherry Valley Cemetery, Athol Township, 
Prince Edward County, Ontario.145 . 

 
 He married (1) Mary Elizabeth Robinson #83148, 07 December 1926 in Prince Edward County, Ontario,146 b. 1906 

in McClure Township, Hastings County, Ontario (daughter of John Oliver (Jack) Robinson #83149 [Farmer in 
Maynooth] and Elizabeth L. Barrager #83150), d. 2003 in Prince Edward County, Ontario,145 buried in Cherry Valley 
Cemetery, Athol Township, Prince Edward County, Ontario.145 
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    Children: 
 
    139. i. Garnet Dean Ackerman #108848 b. 16 November 1930. 
 
    140. ii. Harvey Neil Ackerman #117625 b. 11 April 1932. 
 
 He married (2) Vera Eleanor (Ellen) Simpson #123500, b. 25 February 1903 in Sophiasburgh Township, Prince 

Edward County, Ontario,147 (daughter of George Simpson #95092 [Farmer in Sophiasburgh] and Alida Bovay 
#189803), occupation 1926 Stenographer in Picton, d. 06 June 1975,147 buried in Glenwood Cemetery, Picton, 
Prince Edward County, Ontario.147 

 
112. Helen B. Cole #117633, b. c. 1902 in Chatham, Kent County, Ontario.39 . 
 
 She married Gerald Samuel Farrington #117634, 21 May 1923 in Bloomfield, Prince Edward County, Ontario,148 b. 

24 December 1903 in South Marysburgh Township, Prince Edward County, Ontario,149 (son of Samuel Stewart? 
Farrington #86812 [Yeoman in South Marysburgh] and Annie T. Wood #159923), occupation 1923 Farmer in South 
Marysburgh. 

 
113. Lena Bernice Cole #207862, b. 13 March 1902 in Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario.150 . 
114. Doris Catherine Cole #109867, b. 05 August 1916 in Milford, South Marysburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,151 

d. 05 August 1916 in Milford, South Marysburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,152 buried in Milford, South 
Marysburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario.152 . 

  
  
 (Stillborn) 
  
115. Aylsworth Cole #117635, occupation Captain , Amherst Island Ferry. 
  
  
  
  
116. Norma A. Cole #109015, b. 1917,90 d. 2004,90 buried in Cherry Valley Cemetery, Athol Township, Prince Edward 

County, Ontario.90 . 
117. Lettie Cole #117639, b.39. 
118. Alice Cole #117640, b.39. 
119. Edna Cole #117641. 
120. Hazel Cole #117642, b.39. 
121. Richard Cole #117643, b.39. 
122. Claude Cole #117644. 
123. Jesse Cole #117645. 
124. Hazel Annie Cole #117646, b. 27 July 1910 in Milford, South Marysburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario.153 . 
 
 She married Brian Dodds #117647, b. 14 May 1900,39 d. 13 August 1974.39 
 
    Children: 
 
    141. i. Mary Arlene Dodds #117651. 
 
    142. ii. Margery Alta Dodds #117654 b. 02 April 1937. 
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125. Edna Kathleen Cole #109013, b. 08 June 1913 in South Marysburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario,90,154 d. 
1989,90 buried in Cherry Valley Cemetery, Athol Township, Prince Edward County, Ontario.90 . 

  
  
 She is buried around George COLE/Nellie KEYS, but her birth record shows her parents to be Jesse COLE and Alta 

VALE. 
 
 She married Thomas Christopher Lewis #117650, 26 January 1931 in South Marysburgh, Prince Edward County, 

Ontario,155 b. 15 April 1912 in Belleville, Hastings County, Ontario,39 (son of John Christopher Lewis #224392 and 
Mary Moore #224393), occupation 1931 Salesman in Belleville, d. 21 March 1973.39 

 
    Children: 
 
    143. i. Betty Jane Lewis #117667 b. 12 August 1931. 
 
    144. ii. Thomas Nelson Lewis #117668. 
 
    145. iii. Robert Kent Lewis #117669. 
 
126. Murney Nelson Cole #109014, b. 1912 in Cape Vincent, Jefferson County, New York, USA,90,156 d. 2004,90 buried in 

Cherry Valley Cemetery, Athol Township, Prince Edward County, Ontario.90 . 
  
  
 Moved to Jaffray, British Columbia. 
 
 He married Norma Addie Thompson #117649, 26 April 1935 in South Marysburgh, Prince Edward County, 

Ontario,157 b. c. 1918 in Sophiasburgh Township, Prince Edward County, Ontario (daughter of Harold (Harry) 
Thompson #127089 [Farmer in Sophiasburgh] and Pearl Davis #129621). 

  
 Norma: 
 1935: Lived in Athol Township, Prince Edward County, Ontario when married. 
 
    Children: 
 
    146. i. Harold (Harry) Cole #117664 b. 25 November 1935. 
 
    147. ii. Shirley Cole #117665. 
 
    148. iii. Joan Cole #117666. 
 
127. Norman Edward Schram #119935, b. 26 May 1904 in Michigan, USA,106 d. 21 December 1981 in Pinellas County, 

Florida, USA,102 buried in Forest Lawn Cemetery, Detroit, Wayne County, Michigan, USA.102 . 
 
 He married Helen Holman #229245, 12 October 1925. 
 
    Children: 
 
    149. i. Audrey Winifred Schram #229246 b. 30 July 1927. 
 
    150. ii. Wesley Burwell Schram #229249 b. 23 September 1928. 
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128. Bernard Moran Boulter #207024, b. 19 July 1908 in Big Island, Sophiasburgh Township, Prince Edward County, 
Ontario.158 . 

129. Lorena Ruth Dempsey #192807. 
 
 She married Peter Nelson #192808.121 
 
    Children: 
 
    151. i. Jeffrey Nelson #192814. 
 
    152. ii. Andrew Nelson #192815. 
 
130. Alice Elizabeth Dempsey #192809, b.121. 
 
 She married Howard Whan #192810.121 
 
131. W. Albert Dempsey #192811, b.121. 
 
 He married Susan (unidentified) #192812.121 
 
132. Alexander Lawrence Dempsey #192813. 
133. William Herbert Boulter Rankin #144673, b. 07 February 1923 in Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario,159 d. 15 

February 1923 in Prince Edward County Hospital, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario, buried 16 February 1923 
in Glenwood Cemetery, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario. 

 
Generation Seven 

 
134. Kathleen Cole #117619, b. 02 April 1917 in New York State, USA,160 d. 17 February 1993 in Cayuga County?, New 

York, USA,161 buried in Brookside Cemetery, Watertown, Jefferson County, New York.162 . 
 
 She married George L. Russell #144112, b. 27 November 1912 in New York State, USA,163 occupation 1940 

Draftsman, Light and Power Company in Watertown, d. 26 AUG/September 1975 in Ogdensburg, St. Lawrence 
County, NY,164 buried in Brookside Cemetery, Watertown, Jefferson County, NY.162 

 
    Children: 
 
    153. i. Gerald A. Russell #144113 b. 25 August 1938. 
 
135. Ronald Cole #117620, b.39. 
136. Davis Cole #117621, b.39. 
137. Donna Cole #117622, b.39. 
 
 She married William McDaw #117624.39 
 
138. Claudia Cole #117623, b.39. 
139. Garnet Dean Ackerman #108848, b. 16 November 1930,165,39 d. 30 December 2011 in Barker Street, Picton, Prince 

Edward County, Ontario,165 buried 04 January 2012 Cherry Valley Cemetery, Athol Township, Prince Edward 
County, Ontario.165,166 . 

 
 He married Bernadine M. Henderson #108849, 25 July 1953,165 b. 21 June 1932,165,167 d. 25 January 2020 in 

Hallowell House, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario.167 
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    Children: 
 
    154. i. Lynda Lee Ackerman #117628. 
 
    155. ii. Bonnie Jean Ackerman #117629. 
 
    156. iii. Dennis Ackerman #117627. 
 
140. Harvey Neil Ackerman #117625, b. 11 April 1932 in Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario,168 occupation 

Manager and Designer, Lyons Shoe Company, London, Ontario. 
  
  
 2011: Family lived in Kitchener, Ontario. 
 
 He married Beverley Jane Weston #127839, 09 July 1955,39,168 b. 06 January 1933 in Sandy Creek, Oswego, New 

York State, USA,169,168 (daughter of Ralph James Weston #127835 [Druggist in Syracuse, New York] and Freda 
Avadna (Ada) Scott #102159). 

 
    Children: 
 
    157. i. Neil Scott Ackerman #117630 b. 17 January 1958. 
 
    158. ii. Pamela Rae Ackerman #117631 b. 04 November 1957. 
 
    159. iii. Tracey Diane Ackerman #117632 b. 03 October 1959. 
 
141. Mary Arlene Dodds #117651. 
 
 She married (1) Frederick Bell #117652.39 
 
    Children: 
 
    160. i. Elizabeth Darlene Bell #117656 b. 23 January 1958. 
 
    161. ii. Jennifer Hazel Bell #117657 b. 07 November 1960. 
 
 She married (2) Detlef Pohle #117653.39 
 
    Children: 
 
    162. iii. Melissa Sarah Pohle #117658 b. 01 June 1974. 
 
142. Margery Alta Dodds #117654, b. 02 April 1937.39 . 
 
 She married Glen Howard Calnan #117655, b. 05 July 1934.39 
 
    Children: 
 
    163. i. Brian Glen Calnan #117659 b. 31 December 1955. 
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    164. ii. Terry Dale Calnan #117660 b. 18 September 1957. 
 
    165. iii. Leisa Arlene Calnan #117661 b. 29 January 1961. 
 
    166. iv. Glenda Margery Calnan #117662 b. 31 August 1968. 
 
143. Betty Jane Lewis #117667, b. 12 August 1931.39 . 
 
 She married Grant Kerr #117671.39  They were divorced.39 
 
    Children: 
 
    167. i. Cathy Kerr #117673 b. 12 July 1952. 
 
    168. ii. Thomas Christopher Kerr #117674 b. 26 July 1954. 
 
    169. iii. Gail Bernice Kerr #117675 b. 09 November 1951. 
 
144. Thomas Nelson Lewis #117668, b.39. 
 
 He married Maxine Cross #117672.39 
 
145. Robert Kent Lewis #117669. 
  
  
 Lived in Kingston. 
 
 He married Barbara Knapp #117670.39 
 
    Children: 
 
    170. i. Kent Lewis #117679. 
 
146. Harold (Harry) Cole #117664, b. 25 November 1935 in Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario,170 d. 28 March 

1936 in Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario,170 buried 30 March 1936 in Cherry Valley United Church Cemetery, 
Athol Township, Prince Edward County, Ontario.170 . 

147. Shirley Cole #117665, b.39. 
148. Joan Cole #117666, b.39. 
149. Audrey Winifred Schram #229246, b. 30 July 1927, d. 05 April 1971. 
 
 She married (1) (unidentified) Fredrickson #229247. 
 
  
 She married (2) (unidentified) Emmett #229248. 
 
150. Wesley Burwell Schram #229249, b. 23 September 1928 in Detroit?, never married. 
151. Jeffrey Nelson #192814, b.121. 
152. Andrew Nelson #192815, b.121. 
 

Generation Eight 
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153. Gerald A. Russell #144113, b. 25 August 1938 in Watertown, Jefferson County, New York.163,171 . 
154. Lynda Lee Ackerman #117628, b.39,144. 
 
 She married Terry Mitchell #184441.166 
  
 Terry: 
 Family lived in Elmbrook. 
 
155. Bonnie Jean Ackerman #117629, b.39,144. 
 
 She married Harry Ostrander #184442.166 
  
 Harry: 
 2011: Lived in Picton. 
 
156. Dennis Ackerman #117627, b.39,144. 
  
  
 2011: Lived in Port  Elgin, Ontario. 
 
 He married Nancy (unidentified) #184440.166 
 
157. Neil Scott Ackerman #117630, b. 17 January 1958 in Trenton, Hastings County, Ontario.39,168 . 
 
 He married Brenda Jean Wilcox #127852, 05 June 1982,168 b. 12 November 1958 in Chatham, Ontario. 
 
    Children: 
 
    171. i. Candice Rae Ackerman #127853 b. 16 December 1987. 
 
158. Pamela Rae Ackerman #117631, b. 04 November 1957,39,168 d. before 2011. 
 
 She married Paul Parsons #127848, 08 September 1984 in Ontario,168 b. 20 September 1957 in Goderich, 

Ontario,168 (son of George Parsons #127849 and (unidentified) #127850). 
 
    Children: 
 
    172. i. Matthew Paul Parsons #127851 b. 05 February 1988. 
 
159. Tracey Diane Ackerman #117632, b. 03 October 1959 in Trenton, Hastings County, Ontario.39,168 . 
 
 She married Henry Arnold Knox #127854, 09 August 1984 in London?, Ontario,168 b. 10 June 1963 in London, 

Ontario.168 
 
    Children: 
 
    173. i. Nicole Danielle Knox #127855 b. 11 March 1985. 
 
    174. ii. Jamie Dean Knox #127856 b. 05 June 1987. 
 
160. Elizabeth Darlene Bell #117656, b. 23 January 1958.39 . 
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161. Jennifer Hazel Bell #117657, b. 07 November 1960.39 . 
162. Melissa Sarah Pohle #117658, b. 01 June 1974.39 . 
163. Brian Glen Calnan #117659, b. 31 December 1955.39 . 
164. Terry Dale Calnan #117660, b. 18 September 1957.39 . 
 
 He married Patricia Alma Roy #117663, b. 05 April 1958.39 
 
165. Leisa Arlene Calnan #117661, b. 29 January 1961.39 . 
166. Glenda Margery Calnan #117662, b. 31 August 1968.39 . 
167. Cathy Kerr #117673, b. 12 July 1952.39 . 
 
 She married Allan Kennedy Scott #117676.39 
 
    Children: 
 
    175. i. Michael Christopher Scott #117678 b. 26 August 1977. 
 
168. Thomas Christopher Kerr #117674, b. 26 July 1954.39 . 
 
 He married Angela Akey #117677.39 
 
169. Gail Bernice Kerr #117675, b. 09 November 1951.39 . 
170. Kent Lewis #117679, b.39. 
 

Generation Nine 
 

171. Candice Rae Ackerman #127853, b. 16 December 1987 in London, Ontario.168 . 
172. Matthew Paul Parsons #127851, b. 05 February 1988 in Oshawa?.168 . 
173. Nicole Danielle Knox #127855, b. 11 March 1985 in London?, Ontario.168 . 
174. Jamie Dean Knox #127856, b. 05 June 1987 in London?, Ontario.168 . 
175. Michael Christopher Scott #117678, b. 26 August 1977.39 . 
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62  ONVS Marriages, ref. 010483-1887; Witnesses: Ira E. MARTIN, Athol; Genie (sic) WIGGINS, Napanee. 
63  ONVS Deaths, ref. 007809-1936; c/d: Pulmonary edema, broncho-pneumonia; diabetes acidosis; Informant: Mrs. A.? BENSON, 
Sister-in-law, Picton. 
64  ONVS Deaths, ref. 0929105-1935; c/d: Parkinson's Disease, injury to lumbus vertebrae; Informant: Dr. H. BOULTER, Brother, 
Picton. 
65  ONVS Marriages; ref. 010482-1893; Witnesses: Frank E. BOULTER, Sophiasburgh; Alice CONGER, Hallowell. 
66  1911 Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario census; age/birthdate/relationship. 
67  Michigan Death Records, ref. 1741-1909; c/d: Post -operative ileus, operation for appendicitis. 
68  ONVS Marriages, ref. 001324-1898; Witnesses: Mrs. J.N. BONGARD, Samuel S. BONGARD; both in Toronto. 
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69  1891 Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario census; age/birthplace/relationship. 
70  ONVS Births, ref. 901031; delayed registration based on affidavit of eldest sister Clara. 
71  Michigan County Marriage Records, Wayne County; ref. 227216-1022; Witnesses: James H. BOULTER, Lillian L. BOULTER; 
both in Detroit, Michigan. 
72  ONVS Births, ref. 025200-1877; Informant: Wellington BOULTER. 
73  1921 Hallowell Township, Prince Edward County, Ontario  census; age/birthplace/relationship. 
74  ONVS Births, ref. 029613-1882. 
75  1930 San Diego, San Diego, California, census; age/birthplace/relationship. 
76  1891 Trenton, Hastings County, Ontario census; age/birthplace/relationship. 
77  ONVS Marriages, ref. 011378-1909; Witnesses: Mrs. Elsie I  (STEWART) DENYES, Phillipsville; Mrs. Thomas WILKINS, Jr., 
Marlin?, Ontario. 
78  ONVS Marriages, ref. 021806-1906; Witnesses: Mrs. James TIDOBERRY?, Mrs. MIDDLETON; both in East Toronto. 
79  ONVS Births, ref. 011375-1870. 
80  findagrave.com, Glenwood Cemetery, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario; Section H, Block 485. 
81  ONVS Marriages, ref. 01534-1890; Witnesses: William B. BEER, Annie BEER; both in Milford. 
82  ONVS Births, ref. 009359-1871. 
83  ONVS Deaths, ref. 003520-1947; c/d: Broncho-pneumonia, cerebral embolism; arteriosclerosis, gangrene of foot; Informant: 
Margaret A. COLE, Daughter-in-law, Deseronto./. 
84  ONVS Births, ref. 018885-1873. 
85  ONVS Deaths, ref. 027152-1929; c/d: Cardiac failure, chronic myocarditis, chronic endocarditis; left hemiplegia, arterio-sclerosis. 
86  Alberta Canada Marriage Index. 
87  1901 South Marysburgh, Prince Edward County, Ontario census; birthdate/relationship. 
88  ONVS Births, ref. 029819-1883. 
89  ONVS Births, ref. 026412-1875. 
90  Cherry Valley Cemetery, June 2018; Image 18-05941. 
91  ONVS Marriages, ref. 006633-1900; Witnesses: John A. LOWREY, Kingston; Katie KEYS, Wife Island. 
92  ONVS Deaths, ref. 029868-1936; c/d: Arterio-sclerosis, angina pectoris; Diabetes mellitus; Informant: Aylesworth COLE, 
Husband, South Bay. 
93  ONVS Births, ref. 027351-1877. 
94  ONVS Births, ref. 027361-1879. 
95  ONVS Deaths, ref. 030661-1937; c/d: Pernicious anemia with subacute combined degeneration; Informant: Mr. Claude COLE, 
Brother, Cape Vincent, New York. 
96  Details from daughter Hazel's 1910 birth record. 
97  California Marriage Records, 1850-1941, ref. 45-235, Alameda County. 
98  ONVS Births, ref. 029070-1880. 
99  ONVS Births, ref. 027515-1878. 
100  ONVS Births, ref. 029018-1880. 
101  Michigan Death Records, ref. 01149-1952. 
102  findagrave.com, Forest Lawn Cemetery, Detroit, Wayne County, Michigan, USA. 
103  ONVS Marriages, ref. 014190-1898; Witnesses: Hubert MCDONALD, Hallowell; Lillian BOULTER, Sophiasburgh. 
104  ONVS Births, ref. 026656-1876. 
105  Glenwood Cemetery, Section B, August 2018; Image 18-07984. 
106  1920 Detroit, Michigan census; age/birthplace/relationship. 
107  findagrave.com, Woodmere Cemetery, Detroit, Wayne County, Michigan, USA. 
108  Michigan Divorce Records, 1897-1952; ref. 88011; Grounds: Extreme cruelty. 
109  ONVS Marriages, ref. 018158-1907; Witnesses’. Howard CRYAN, M.D., Demorestville; Grace MORAN, Big Island. 
110  ONVS Births, ref. 028060-1894. 
111  ONVS Births, ref. 029289-1890. 
112  ONVS Births, Prince Edward County, 1897 (no additional reference details). 
113  ONVS Births, ref. 029286-1890. 
114  ONVS Births, ref. 035061-1901. 
115  ONVS Births, ref. 030007-1883. 
116  ONVS Births, ref. 039881-1895. 
117  1900 Syracuse, Onondaga County, New York, USA census; age/birthplace/relationship. 
118  ONVS Marriages, ref. 030315-1926; Witnesses: L. CARDINAL. H.J. MACDONALD; both in Toronto. 
119  ONVS Births, ref. 038636-1906. 
120  The Ottawa Journal (Ottawa), 01 JUN 1948; Engagement Announcement. 
121  The Ottawa Citizen (Ottawa), 15 AUG 1885; Dr. Ethel Agnes DEMPSEY, Obituary. 
122  ONVS Marriages, ref. 049214-1926; Witnesses: Bruce McLelland GIBSON, Vivian Mae DOAN; both in Newmarket. 
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123  ONVS Births, Revised Registration, ref. 030010-1887. 
124  ONVS Births, ref. 028122-1894. 
125  ONVS Births, ref. 035913-1898. 
126  ONVS Births, ref. 035066-1901. 
127  ONVS Births, ref. 040138-1907. 
128  ONVS Births, ref. 028161-1892. 
129  findagrave.com, Glenwood Cemetery, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario, Section O, Block 684. 
130  ONVS Marriages, ref. 019134-1914; Witnesses: Marjorie H. DOUGLAS, Ottawa; H. HIDGSON, Toronto. 
131  ONVS Births, ref. 027899-1895. 
132  findagrave.com, Christ Church Cathedral Columbarium, Victoria, British Columbia, Canada. 
133  ONVS Births, ref. 035877-1898. 
134  ONVS Marriages, ref. 019243-1921; Witnesses: Olive M. RANKIN, 451 Gladstone Avenue; Bernice L. HARRINGTON, 465v 
Avline? Road; both in Toronto. 
135  1921 Moncton, New Brunswick, Canada census; age/birthplace/relationship. 
136  ONVS Births, ref. 028405-1892. 
137  ONVS Deaths, ref. 019885-1941; c/d: Coronary thrombosis; Informant: Margaret Alice COLE, Wife, Deseronto. 
138  New York County Marriage Records, Cape Vincent, Jefferson County. 
139  ONVS Births, Prince Edward County, 1897. 
140  findsagrave.com, Glenwood Cemetery, Picton, Prince Edward County, Ontario; Section E, Block 652. 
141  ONVS Marriages, ref. 018161-1922; Witnesses: J.E. BAXTER, Bloomfield; J.M. MCCUTCHEON; 33 Yeoman Street, 
Belleville. 
142  ONVS Births, ref. 040645-1907. 
143  1911 Alberta, Canada census, age/birthplace/relationship. 
144  MAGRC Murray Clapp Ackerman Genealogies. 
145  Cherry Valley Cemetery, June 2018; Image 18-05868. 
146  ONVS Marriages, ref. 043157-1926; Witnesses: Robert John HARVEY, and Oriole Fleming HARVEY, both in Picton. 
147  Glenwood Cemetery, Picton; Section I, November 2018; Image 18-10809. 
148  ONVS Marriages, ref. 019275-1923; Witnesses: Miss Sylvia STARK, Mrs, Edna MCQUADE; both in Bloomfield. 
149  ONVS Births, ref. 038463-1904. 
150  ONVS Births, ref. 037063-1902. 
151  ONVS Births, ref. 048457-1916. 
152  ONVS Deaths, ref. 028832-1916; c/d: Stillborn; Informant: Aylsworth COLE, Milford. 
153  ONVS Births, ref. 042214-1910. 
154  ONVS Births, Delayed Registration; ref. 501365-1949. 
155  ONVS Marriages, ref. 018002-1931; Witnesses: Eunice SCOTT, Picton; Orliff A. LLOYD, Belleville. 
156  Parents’ names from 1935 marriage record. 
157  ONVS Marriages, ref. 019840-1935; Witnesses: Mary WHARMBY, Picton; W.D.P. DIXON, Milford. 
158  ONVS Births, ref. 042546-1908. 
159  ONVS Deaths, ref. 029366-1923; c/hemophilia, six days; Informant: William RANKIN, Picton, Father. 
160  1920 Clifton, St. Lawrence County, New York census; age/birthplace/relationship. 
161  SSDI, SSN 126-12-4276. 
162  findagrave.com. Brookside Cemetery, Watertown, Jefferson County, New York. 
163  1940 Watertown, Jefferson County, Ontario census; age/birthplace/relationship. 
164  SSDI SSN 075-07-2210. 
165  Cherry Valley Cemetery, June 2018; Image 18-05867. 
166  Whattam Funeral Home Death Notice, Garnet Ackerman, 30 DEC 2011. 
167  Whattam Funeral Home Death Notice, Bernadine Maude Ackerman; 25 JAN 2020. 
168  MAGRC Rose ROS 002-6, Murray CLAPP edited and appended to by Muriel RORABECK. 
169  1940: Sandy Creek, Oswego, New York census; age/birthplace/relationship. 
170  ONVS Deaths, ref. 029915-1936; c/d: Pneumonia, Hydrocephalus, spina bifida; Informant: Murney COLE, Father, Picton. 
171  New York State Birth Index. 
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